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LUCY DAVIES TO STEP DOWN AS EXECUTIVE DIRECTOR OF THE
YOUNG VIC TO BECOME CHIEF EXECUTIVE OF BRIGHTON DOME

AND BRIGHTON FESTIVAL

The Young Vic Theatre has today announced that Executive Director Lucy Davies will
leave the organisation in December 2024 to take up the position of Chief Executive of
Brighton Dome and Brighton Festival. Sarah Nicholson will join the Young Vic as Interim
Executive Director where she will work alongside incoming Artistic Director and Chief
Executive Nadia Fall, whilst recruitment for Lucy’s replacement takes place. Nicholson joins
the organisation from RTYDS (the Regional Theatre Young Director Scheme) where she is
currently part-time Interim Executive Director alongside her freelance work.

Since joining the Young Vic in May 2022, alongside the organisation’s outgoing CEO and
Artistic Director Kwame Kwei-Armah, Lucy has overseen major productions such as the
internationally-acclaimed, The Second Woman, a 24-hour feat of endurance theatre
performed by Ruth Wilson and 100 different men, non-binary and queer people; the UK
premiere and West End transfer of Daniel Fish’s multi-award-winning production of Rodgers
& Hammerstein's Oklahoma!; and the West End transfer of James Graham’s critically
acclaimed Best of Enemies. Over the next four months Lucy will present the World
Premiere of Elvis Costello and Sarah Ruhl’s new musical A Face in the Crowd - the final
production from Kwame Kwei-Armah’s tenure as Artistic Director; and a new production of
Lillian Hellman’s The Little Foxes directed by Lyndsey Turner and starring Anne-Marie Duff.

Lucy Davies says: “The Young Vic is a vital, wonderful community of extraordinary talents
with a genuine culture of kindness, adventurousness, imagination and care. We have
travelled far in my years there, and made some amazing unforgettable work. It has been a
privilege to be on the leadership team alongside Kwame at such a dynamic theatre during
what we all recognise are challenging times for our sector. I have forged some lifelong
professional friendships during this time, and been enriched by my inspiring colleagues and
Trustees. My new role is completely irresistible and I look forward to following the next era
for the Young Vic led by Nadia which, I have absolute confidence, is going to be stellar.”

Glenn Earle, Young Vic Chair says: “I would like to thank Lucy, personally and on behalf of
the Board of Trustees, for her tremendous contributions as Executive Director of the Young
Vic.

Lucy has brought to the role not only extraordinary experience and expertise, but also
unceasing passion and compassion and has helped Kwame to navigate our wonderful
theatre through some of the most difficult times our sector has experienced. We will miss
Lucy and I wish her well for her new important position in Brighton."

Prior to joining the Young Vic, Lucy spent nine years as Executive Producer at The Royal
Court Theatre where she produced over 100 World Premieres. Lucy was the founding
Executive Producer at National Theatre Wales which she launched in 2009 with Artistic
Director John McGrath, producing the first three years of work including The Passion with
Michael Sheen across the whole town of Port Talbot.

https://drive.google.com/file/d/1E5CjxNzHsUn-I6FF02EM2SDzr6cYLhzS/view?usp=sharing


Previously, Lucy was Executive Producer at the Donmar Warehouse, Head of Studio at the
National Theatre and spent the 1990s as Literary Manager at the Donmar Warehouse,
where she produced an annual season of new plays, before leaving for five years in the film
industry. She started her career as an Assistant Director at Kneehigh Theatre.

Lucy Davies is Co-Chair with Alessandro Babalola of Soho Theatre Walthamstow and is a
Creative Climate Leader and Creative Green Champion 2020 and a Fellow of the RSA.
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About the Young Vic Theatre 
Founded in 1970 as a space for world-premiere productions and unexpected takes on
classic plays that speak urgently to our present, the Young Vic Theatre has been one of
London’s leading theatres for more than fifty years.

Welcoming more than 100,000 visitors a year to its London Waterloo location, the Young Vic
stands out in the city’s cultural landscape for balancing daring commercial drive, success
and artistic flair with genuine grassroots social impact change in our neighbourhood. We
forge deep connections in our neighbourhood through our Taking Part programme, where we
engage with over 15,000 people every year via a wide range of projects, from skills-based
workshops to on-stage performances. We give 10% of our tickets free to schools and
neighbours, irrespective of box office demand, and we are committed to keeping ticket prices
low.

The Young Vic’s Creators Program is our space for multi- and anti-disciplinary artists, and is
the only scheme of its kind. Launched in 2001, and formerly known as the Directors
Program, we offer artists and producers a unique opportunity to develop their craft through
opportunities that range from trainee and assistant director roles to a two-year residency
through the Genesis Fellow/Associate Director position. The Genesis Network provides an
online community to over 2,500 artists and producers. Each year, the recipient of the
Genesis Future Directors Award directs a show in the Clare Theatre with full support from
the Young Vic team.

Built upon the principles of access, innovation, and community, the Young Vic is deepening
its roots nationally and internationally. Recent transfers include a Death of a Salesman and
The Collaboration on Broadway, and Best of Enemies and Rodgers & Hammerstein’s
Oklahoma! in the West End.

The Young Vic’s founding spirit is iconoclastic and pushing at the forefront of possibility,
bringing together artists and audiences on a global scale and using the power of stories to
change our world.
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The Young Vic’s annual activities are made possible with public funding from Arts
Council England.   

We thank Lambeth Council and Southwark Council for their ongoing support.

Additional support is provided by The Black Heart Foundation and the Genesis
Foundation.   

We gratefully acknowledge Ian Burford and Alec Cannell for generously supporting
the Young Vic’s mission. 

Thank you to all of our donors who make our work possible.

http://www.youngvic.org/

